

EXHIBIT D



HAGENS BERMAN

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

HAGENS BERMAN SOBOL SHAPIRO LLP
1918 EIGHTH AVENUE, SUITE 3300
SEATTLE, WA 98101
www.hbsslaw.com

December 18, 2014
Hyundai/Kia MPG
Client/Matter # 10339-0010
Invoice No: 267749436

RE: General

Billing Summary Through December 10, 2014

Fees For Professional Services	\$78,590.00
Expenses and Advances	\$802.63
CURRENT BILL	\$79,392.63
TOTAL BALANCE DUE	\$79,392.63

Client No.: 10339

Page 2

Invoice No.: 267749436

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			HOURS	AMOUNT
12/5/2012	RBC	Phone conference with Shana Scarlett re media and class rep issues (.2); prepare brief re upcoming interview (.8).	0.80	\$460.00
12/17/2012	RBC	Meet with Camille Bass re Transportation Safety Board issue.	0.30	\$180.00
12/17/2012	RBC	Review waiver of service filings.	0.20	\$120.00
12/27/2012	RBC	Correspondence with client re case status.	0.30	\$180.00
1/8/2013	RBC	Investigate specific facts pertaining to client.	0.90	\$540.00
2/5/2013	RBC	Research re Canadian plaintiff issue.	0.50	\$300.00
2/22/2013	RBC	Research regarding class member issues.	0.70	\$420.00
2/22/2013	RBC	Review materials re other complaints involving Sonata car model (2.7); find advertisement representations and review same (1.8).	4.50	\$2,700.00
2/22/2013	RBC	Confer with co-counsel re Sonata assignment.	0.50	\$300.00
2/22/2013	RBC	Communicate with co-counsel re contacts.	0.60	\$360.00
3/12/2013	RBC	Correspondence with Michael Kidney re Canada numbers and Sonata issue.	1.50	\$900.00
3/18/2013	RBC	Attend mediation with Judge Sundvold.	6.30	\$3,780.00
3/22/2013	RBC	Go over notes and follow up on action items from Status Conference 3/21.	2.30	\$1,380.00
3/26/2013	RBC	Communicate with counsel re status conference.	0.80	\$480.00
3/26/2013	RBC	Prepare for phone call with Liaison Counsel.	0.80	\$480.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 3

Invoice No.: 267749436

3/26/2013	RBC	Phone call with Steve Berman re status conference.	0.10	\$60.00
3/26/2013	RBC	Review previous spreadsheet re Kia and work through and adjust discrepancies as necessary.	1.50	\$900.00
3/26/2013	RBC	Communicate with Michael Kidney re structure and Monroney numbers.	0.50	\$300.00
3/26/2013	RBC	Phone call with Liason Counsel re status conference.	0.50	\$300.00
3/27/2013	RBC	Analysis of Kia issues.	0.80	\$480.00
3/27/2013	RBC	Analysis of discovery issue with regard to non-original ownership.	1.10	\$660.00
3/27/2013	RBC	Confer with Camille Bass re status update.	0.50	\$300.00
3/27/2013	RBC	Research issue regarding Kia numbers.	1.50	\$900.00
3/28/2013	RBC	Attend status conference (including preparatory pre meeting with Steve Berman).	2.80	\$1,680.00
3/28/2013	RBC	Travel to Los Angeles from Phoenix.	3.30	\$1,980.00
3/28/2013	RBC	Outline plan for preliminary discovery and document production	0.50	\$300.00
3/28/2013	RBC	Travel to Phoenix from Los Angeles.	2.50	\$1,500.00
3/29/2013	RBC	Conference call with Steve Berman re status and next steps.	1.30	\$780.00
3/29/2013	RBC	Meeting with Liason Counsel Eric Gibbs re status information.	1.50	\$900.00
3/29/2013	RBC	Follow-up communication with Eric Gibbs regarding status conference .	0.10	\$60.00
3/29/2013	RBC	Follow-up communication with Eric Gibbs regarding case status .	0.10	\$60.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 4

Invoice No.: 267749436

3/30/2013	RBC	Research and analysis of issues pertaining to Canada.	2.30	\$1,380.00
4/1/2013	RBC	Participate in discussion with parties and Liaison Counsel re case status.	0.80	\$480.00
4/2/2013	RBC	Draft percertification communication letter and confer with Steve Berman.	0.80	\$480.00
4/2/2013	RBC	Address issues re Canada for Michael Peerless.	0.80	\$480.00
4/2/2013	RBC	Communicate with Steve Berman re precertification communication letter.	0.10	\$60.00
4/2/2013	RBC	Analysis of transcript issue.	0.10	\$60.00
4/2/2013	RBC	Revise motion (1.3); communicate with counsel re discovery dispute and class certification extension issues.	2.50	\$1,500.00
4/3/2013	RBC	Communicate with co-counsel re settlement terms.	0.30	\$180.00
4/3/2013	RBC	Communication with Michael Kidney re discovery documents and outstanding settlement issues.	0.30	\$180.00
4/3/2013	RBC	Phone call with Opposing Counsel Joseph Ashby re settlement issues.	0.30	\$180.00
4/3/2013	RBC	Draft letter to counsel re class notice opt out in Bird (.5); copy letter to Eric Gibbs re same (.2); research re pre-certification notice (.7); review Bird documents (.9)	2.30	\$1,380.00
4/3/2013	RBC	Phone call with counsel (Michael Kidney and Jason Erb) re discovery schedule (.8); follow ups with Steve Berman and Rich McCune re same (.7).	1.50	\$900.00
4/4/2013	RBC	Meeting with opposing counsel re Liaison status.	0.30	\$180.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 5

Invoice No.: 267749436

4/4/2013	RBC	Review document production in Bird case.	0.80	\$480.00
4/4/2013	RBC	Develop discovery schedule and assignments for case team.	1.10	\$660.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Arrange case management assignments with Steve Berman.	0.60	\$360.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Discuss confirmatory discovery issues with Steve Berman related to approach, staffing and budget.	0.30	\$180.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Prepare information re settlement in preparation for discussion with Michael Kidney.	0.30	\$180.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Status conference and document disclosure.	0.80	\$480.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Meeting with Michael Kidney re Kia issues.	0.10	\$60.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Arrange telephone conference with counsel	0.10	\$60.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Correspondence with Eric Gibbs re Status Conference issues.	0.10	\$60.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Correspondence with Steve Berman re scheduling issues.	0.10	\$60.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Meet with attorney John DeStefano to discuss his role and responsibilities with regard to case.	0.20	\$120.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Correspondence with Michael Kidney re document timing.	0.20	\$120.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Correspondence with Eric Gibbs re administration of document release.	0.10	\$60.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Correspondence with counsel re Sonata exclusion.	0.50	\$300.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Correspondence with Eric Gibbs re timing of document production.	0.10	\$60.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Correspondence with Michael Kidney re Kia issue.	0.10	\$60.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 6

Invoice No.: 267749436

4/5/2013	RBC	Establish approach to ensure efficient document review (1); set up Eric Gibbs phone call (.1).	1.10	\$660.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Telephone conference with opposing counsel re mileage statistics and usage in agreement.	0.50	\$300.00
4/5/2013	RBC	Conference with Steve Berman and Camille Bass re approach on documents.	0.50	\$300.00
4/6/2013	RBC	Draft memorandum to opposing counsel re settlement issues.	0.20	\$120.00
4/6/2013	RBC	Discussion with counsel re approach for status conference.	0.30	\$180.00
4/8/2013	RBC	Arrange repository of documents.	0.50	\$300.00
4/8/2013	RBC	Meeting with Steve Berman re case management .	0.30	\$180.00
4/8/2013	RBC	Assess existing production materials.	1.20	\$720.00
4/8/2013	RBC	Telephone call with Eric Gibbs.	0.50	\$300.00
4/8/2013	RBC	Briefing with John DeStefano on case background	0.80	\$480.00
4/8/2013	RBC	Correspondence with Joseph Ashby.	0.30	\$180.00
4/8/2013	RBC	Telephone call with Michael Kidney and Jason Erb re discovery issues.	0.80	\$480.00
4/9/2013	RBC	Communication with Michael Kidney re document production issues.	0.20	\$120.00
4/9/2013	RBC	Communication with Eric Gibbs regarding approach to Status Conference.	0.50	\$300.00
4/9/2013	RBC	Analysis of discovery issue re Kia.	0.50	\$300.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 7

Invoice No.: 267749436

4/9/2013	RBC	Prepare notice to court regarding status of document disclosure.	0.80	\$480.00
4/9/2013	RBC	Telephone call with opposing counsel regarding scheduling and documentation.	0.80	\$480.00
4/9/2013	RBC	Telephone call with Eric Gibbs regarding liaison report.	0.80	\$480.00
4/10/2013	RBC	Communicate with counsel re extension and affect on schedule.	0.20	\$120.00
4/10/2013	RBC	Call with Kidney re notice and clearance and corresponding terms of change.	0.50	\$300.00
4/10/2013	RBC	Discuss Status Conference and Notice with Eric Gibbs.	0.50	\$300.00
4/10/2013	RBC	Work on fuel price issues with Michael Kidney and Michael Peerless.	0.50	\$300.00
4/10/2013	RBC	Work with Michael Kidney re notice (.3); coordinate with Eric Gibbs re same (.2).	0.50	\$300.00
4/10/2013	RBC	Prepare redlines of notice (.4); email team re changes (.2).	0.60	\$360.00
4/10/2013	RBC	Correspondence with Steve Berman re status conference and issues pertaining to same.	0.30	\$180.00
4/10/2013	RBC	Discuss case status with Leonard Aragon.	0.30	\$180.00
4/10/2013	RBC	Correspondence with Eric Gibbs and Michael Kidney re notice and report.	0.30	\$180.00
4/15/2013	RBC	Assess documents in Defendant's system (1.3); correspond internally re documents (2.5).	3.80	\$2,280.00
4/24/2013	RBC	Travel from Phoenix to Burbank.	3.30	\$1,980.00
4/24/2013	RBC	Review materials in preparatio for conference with opposing counsel, and conference with same.	2.30	\$1,380.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 8

Invoice No.: 267749436

4/25/2013	RBC	Travel from Burbank to Phoenix.	3.50	\$2,100.00
4/25/2013	RBC	Meeting with co-counsel (1.1); meeting with Eric Gibbs (.4).	1.50	\$900.00
4/25/2013	RBC	Post-hearing meeting with counsel re approach to documents (1.5); call with Michael Kidney re same (1).	2.50	\$1,500.00
4/25/2013	RBC	Attend court conference.	3.30	\$1,980.00
5/6/2013	RBC	Correspondence with Eric Gibbs and Michael Kindey to address issues re final numbers, doc management, and court reporting.	1.80	\$1,080.00
5/6/2013	RBC	Organize and strategize re document management and production with Andy St. John	0.80	\$480.00
5/13/2013	RBC	Telephone Conference with Eric Gibbs re case status.	0.80	\$480.00
5/17/2013	CZH	Review, rate and tag documents on EasyESI related to print ads and advertising materials.	2.00	\$500.00
5/17/2013	CZH	Reviewed, rated & tagged documents on EasyESI related to advertising materials.	2.00	\$500.00
5/20/2013	CZH	Review, rate and tag documents on EasyESI related to advertising materials, print ads, other commercial scripts, and internet ads and banners.	3.00	\$750.00
5/20/2013	CZH	Review, rate and tag documents on EasyESI related to advertising materials, print ads, and other commercial scripts.	2.00	\$500.00
5/21/2013	CZH	Review, rate and tag documents on EasyESI related to reimbursement program.	2.00	\$500.00
5/29/2013	CZH	Review, rate and tag documents on EasyESI related to reimbursement program.	2.50	\$625.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 9

Invoice No.: 267749436

5/29/2013	CZH	Review, rate and tag documents on EasyESI related to government inquiries.	2.50	\$625.00
5/30/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents on EasyESI for all Kia-Related documents, marking all KMAST pre-fixed bate stamps with code "manufacturer-KIA".	3.30	\$825.00
5/31/2013	CZH	Email Andy St. John re memorandum with attached list of customer complaints for upcoming depositions.	0.30	\$75.00
5/31/2013	CZH	Draft memorandum to Andy St. John re relevant customer complaints.	1.00	\$250.00
5/31/2013	CZH	Compile list of customer complaints in preparation for upcoming depositions in Korea.	3.00	\$750.00
5/31/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents on EasyESI related to individual customer complaints regarding overstated MPG.	3.70	\$925.00
6/3/2013	CZH	Review all documents with batestamps prefix HMAST and code with "Manufacturer: Hyundai".	2.20	\$550.00
6/4/2013	CZH	Meeting with Leonard Aragon re document review status.	0.40	\$100.00
6/6/2013	CZH	Email Andy St. John re document review status.	0.20	\$50.00
6/10/2013	CZH	Email Leonard Aragon, Jennifer Shavers and Crystal Ewell re set up time for conference re doc review status.	0.20	\$50.00
6/10/2013	CZH	Review documents with Batestamps Prefix HKMST and Coded documents by manufacturer (either Kia or Hyundai).	2.40	\$600.00
6/11/2013	CZH	Meeting with Leonard Aragon and Jennifer Shavers re document review status.	0.20	\$50.00
6/13/2013	CZH	Review and code documents with batestamp Prefix HKMCST testing data and reports.	0.80	\$200.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 10

Invoice No.: 267749436

6/13/2013	CZH	Review and code documents with Prefix HKMCST containing testing procedures and data.	1.60	\$400.00
6/13/2013	CZH	Email to Andy St. John re document review questions and scheduling meeting.	0.10	\$25.00
6/14/2013	CZH	Cross-reference previously created and affixed "Tags" with new Codes (2.3); prepare notes for future coding (.4).	2.70	\$675.00
7/1/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents HMAST0001500-HMAST0001662.	2.00	\$500.00
7/1/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HMAST0001663 - HMAST0002033.	1.20	\$300.00
7/2/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents HMAST0001663-HMAST0002512.	1.00	\$250.00
7/9/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HMAST0006000-HMAST0006500.	2.50	\$625.00
7/10/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HMAST0006501-HMAST0006700.	1.50	\$375.00
7/17/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents HMAST0008501-9000.	0.70	\$175.00
7/17/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents HMAST0007501-8000.	0.80	\$200.00
7/17/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents HMAST0008001-8500.	0.90	\$225.00
7/17/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents HMAST0009501-10000.	1.00	\$250.00
7/17/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents HMAST0007001-HMAST0007500.	1.00	\$250.00
7/17/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents HMAST0009001-9500.	1.20	\$300.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 11

Invoice No.: 267749436

7/18/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HKMCST10000494_TR to HKMCST10000514.	1.50	\$375.00
7/18/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HKMCST10000386_TR to HKMCST10000401_TR.	2.50	\$625.00
7/23/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HMAST0063392-63804.	1.50	\$375.00
7/23/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HKMCST0017688-001769.	0.50	\$125.00
7/23/2013	CZH	Compile list of documents HKMCST10000514-872 organized by corresponding document titles.	1.00	\$250.00
7/23/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HKMCST10000762-HKMCST10000872.	1.50	\$375.00
7/23/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HKMCST10000610-HKMCST10000656.	1.50	\$375.00
7/23/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents HKMCST10000514_TR -HKMCST1000546.	1.50	\$375.00
7/24/2013	CZH	Compile list of documents HMAST0063392-64297 organized by corresponding document titles.	1.50	\$375.00
7/24/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents HMAST0063805-64297.	3.50	\$875.00
7/25/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HMAST 0010865-HMAST00109500.	1.40	\$350.00
7/25/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HMAST0010000-HMAST0010864.	1.30	\$325.00
7/25/2013	CZH	Email compiled lists plus summary of documents by section to Andy St. John for review.	0.60	\$150.00
7/25/2013	CZH	Compile list of documents HMAST0064298-64332 organized by corresponding document titles.	0.90	\$225.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 12

Invoice No.: 267749436

7/25/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HMAST0064298-64332.	1.50	\$375.00
7/26/2013	CZH	Meeting with Leonard Aragon re document review status.	0.20	\$50.00
7/26/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HMAST0011250-HMAST0011500.	2.00	\$500.00
7/26/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HMAST0011201-HMAST0011250.	2.00	\$500.00
7/26/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HMAST0011001-HMAST0011200.	3.00	\$750.00
7/26/2013	CZH	Review, rate and code documents: HMAST00109500-HMAST0011000.	1.60	\$400.00
1/28/2014	MLP	Respond to emails and telephone calls from potential class members and update database accordingly.	0.70	\$105.00
9/24/2014	CJ	Meet with John DeStefano re hearing transcripts (.1); assist Audrey Moore with Joinder re Answer to Petition 23(f).(3).	0.40	\$60.00
9/26/2014	RBC	Phone call with opposing counsel Michael Kidney.	0.80	\$480.00

Total Fees

\$78,590.00

SERVICES RECAP

		HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
RBC	Carey, Rob B	0.80	575.00	\$460.00
RBC	Carey, Rob B	95.40	600.00	\$57,240.00
CZH	Horan, Claudia Z	82.90	250.00	\$20,725.00
CJ	Johnson, Cindy J	0.40	150.00	\$60.00
MLP	Perkins, Marci L	0.70	150.00	\$105.00

Client No.: 10339

Page 13

Invoice No.: 267749436

EXPENSES

12/21/2012	LexisNexis; Invoice # 1211007022; Online Services/Legal Research. LexisNexis usage for period of 11/01/12 - 11/30/12.	\$27.54
01/17/2013	American Express; Invoice # Dec-12 AMEX (Berman); Hotel, Newport Beach, 12/12-12/14/12	\$508.92
02/12/2013	UPS - SEATTLE; Invoice # 0000X2X719043; Overnight shipping. Package sent on 01/25/13	\$24.08
03/06/2013	Petty Cash - Seattle Office; Invoice # Replenish 03/06/13; Misc. costs. Reimbursement Heather Westre for Certificate of Good standing.	\$1.00
04/18/2013	Pacer Service Center; Invoice # HB0116-Q12013; Online Services/Legal Research. Pacer charges for period of 01/01/2013 - 03/31/2013.	\$0.90
04/23/2013	Petty Cash - Seattle Office; Invoice # Replenish 04/23/13; TRANSPORTATION/TRAVEL EXPENSES. Travel advance for Steve Berman for travel on week of 03/17/13.	\$66.67
09/12/2014	LexisNexis; Invoice # 1408006509; Online Services/Legal Research. LexisNexis usage for period of 08/01/14 - 08/31/14.	\$3.52
12/10/2014	Copies	\$170.00
Total Expenses		\$802.63
